BID NO. 2016-X MOWER BLADES & MIX OIL

BID TABULATION

| ITEM MIKES BIKES BOONE EQUIPMENT GREENS MARINE MIKELL'S
BLADES

HUSQVARNA PZ60 $7.95 ea. 9.11ea $7.25 ea. $8.75 ea.
SCAG TIGER CATSTC61V $7.25 ea. 9.25 ea. $7.25 ea. $8.75 ea.
GRASSHOPPER 329 60" $7.95 ea. 16.61 ea. $11.99 ea $9.65 ea.
HUSTLER SUPER Z 72"

REAR DISCHARGE $29.85 per set of 3 $49.59 per set of 3 $41.33 per set NO BID

TRIMMER LINE 3LB SPOOL
450' ROLL 8 CUTTING

EDGES

0.095 NO BID
0.105 NO BID
0.13 NO BID
0.155 NO BID

2 STROKE MIX OIL
| GALLON 48 per case
2.5 GALLON 48 per case

$69.60 per case

*51.50 per case

* 24 bottle case
2x51.60=103.20

$30.72 per spool
$30.72 per spool
$30.72 per spool
$30.72 per spool

$61.91 per case
$90.82 per case

$32.99 per spool
$32.99 per spool
$32.99 per spool
$53.99 per spool

$84.80 per case
$132.00 per case

$29.00 per spool
$29.00 per spool
$29.00 per spool
$29.00 per spool

$50.10 per case
$82.50 per case



